THE BID COMMITTEE WILL MEET
IN THE CITY CLERK’S CONFERENCE
ROOM, 200 N. WALKER 2ND FLOOR,
MUNICIPAL BUILDING, AT 10:00 A.M.

OR LATER.

City Clerk Bid Committee Bid Tab

Bid MC-0757 Ended At Nov 6, 2024 10:00:00 AM CST

CONSTRUCTION/OCPPA - Oklahoma River Dredging
Company: C-P Integrated Services
Base Bid $3,470,000.00
Alternate No. 1 $9,000.00
Alternate No. 2 $7,500.00
TOTAL BID: $3,486,500.00

Chad Harrison Tim Alvarez

City Clerk Purchasing Agent Auditor

Potential Bid Defects Noted:

#1
#2
#3
#4
#5

Anti-collusion affidavit not properly notarized

Bid Bond missing

Bid Bond incorrect awarding agency

Bid Bond insufficient amount

Business relationship affidavit not properly notarized

THE BID COMMITTEE DOES NOT REJECT OR ACCEPT BIDS. The noting or failing to note on the bid
tabulation any defect by the Bid Committee is not conclusive of the validity, regularity, completeness or

legality of any bid. Questions regarding bid defects or irregularities should be directed to the Municipal
Counselor’s Office at (405) 297-2451.

Originating Department shall:

1.

Carefully examine and evaluate all opened bids, including a review of potential defects noted by the Bid Committee;
and

Contact your legal representative prior to recommending contract award based on a bid with any potential or
perceived irregularity or defect; and

Prepare a memorandum to Council or its Trusts with recommendations regarding contract award, listing all bids
opened and noting any defects; and

Attach a copy of the Bid Committee’s bid tabulation with the SIRE item recommending contract award as a non-
published document for review by staff.
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Bid #MC-0757 - Oklahoma River Dredging

Creation Date Jun 27, 2024 End Date Nov 6, 2024 10:00:00 AM CST
Start Date Jul 31, 2024 7:35:48 AM CDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

MC-0757--01-01 Base Bid: Unit price for Removal and disposal of sediment from the impouned Sedimentation

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price| Attch. Docs
C-P Integrated Services a First Offer - $32.50 | 30000 / cubic yard $975,000.00 i l
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Uploaded on this line item is the special contractors

questionnaire

MC-0757--01-02 Base Bid: Unit price for Removal and disposal of sediment from the drained Sedimentation B

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price| Attch. Docs
C-P Integrated Services m First Offer - $34.50 | 30000 / cubic yard $1,035,000.00 @
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

MC-0757--01-03 Base Bid: Unit price for the removal and disposal of sediment from the impounded Lake Basi

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price| Attch. Docs
C-P Integrated Services a First Offer - $35.50 | 20000 / cubic yard $710,000.00 @
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

MC-0757--01-04 Base Bid: Unit price for Removal and disposal of sediment from the drained Lake Basins

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price| Attch. Docs
C-P Integrated Services m First Offer - $37.50 | 20000 / cubic yard $750,000.00 @
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

MC-0757--02-01 Alternate No. 1: Repair of the primary access gates

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
C-P Integrated Services m First Offer - $9,000.00 | 1/lump sum $9,000.00 @
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

MC-0757--03-01 Alternate No. 2: Establish emergency egress through cable fence along trail adjacent to the east

Supplier Unit Price| Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
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C-P Integrated Services [ | | First Offer - $7,500.00 | 1/lump sum $7,500.oo| | il

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Supplier Totals

f C-PIntegrated Services $3,486,500.00 (6/6 items)
Bid Contact  Durinda Fisher Address 3007 NW 63rd Street, Ste
dfisher@cpiokc.com 205
Ph 405-732-0532 Oklahoma City, OK 73116
Qualifications OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS
Bid Bond |.i| (Status: Authorized on Sep 3, 2024)
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head
Attch:

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet. However, the listing of the bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet shall
not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being responsive. The
agency will make a determination as to the responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, purchasing guidelines
and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The agency will notify the successful vendor upon award of the
contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received may be available for inspection at that time.
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THE BID COMMITTEE WILL MEET
IN THE CITY CLERK’S CONFERENCE
ROOM, 200 N. WALKER 2ND FLOOR,
MUNICIPAL BUILDING, AT 10:00 A.M.

OR LATER.
Bid Committee Bid Tab
Bid #OCWUT 03-25 - Laboratory Chemicals, Supplies, and Accessories
Creation Date Sep 16, 2024 End Date Nov 6, 2024 10:00:00 AM CST
Start Date Sep 25, 2024 8:52:49 AM CDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded
Thomas Scientific LLC $0.00 (18/18 items)
Bid Contact Quotes Team Address 1654 High Hill Road
quotes@thomassci.com SWEDESBORO, NJ 08085
Ph 828-418-1060

Bid Notes Thomas Scientific has offered a Discount Schedule for every category of our catalog. Our full catalog is comprehensive and readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.
Our catalog includes over 1 million products. We continuously update and expand our product offerings to stay aligned with the latest research and market demands, ensuring we meet
your evolving needs. Our Discounts will remain firm for the Term Length of the agreement. Please reach out to us with any questions regarding our response.

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific

has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--01-02 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer 1.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 1.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific

has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--01-03 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer l 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific

has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
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full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

l 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--01-05 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item

Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--02-01 Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test - First Offer

1.00% | 1/each 1.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item

Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--03-01 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS - First Offer

1.00% | 1/each 1.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:




Thomas Scientific has offered a
Discount Schedule for every
category of our catalog. Our full
catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--03-02

Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC - First Offer

1.00% | 1/each 1.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Thomas Scientific has offered a
Discount Schedule for every
category of our catalog. Our full
catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Lot Total: $0.00

Item #

Line Item

Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--04-01

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Thomas Scientific has offered a
Discount Schedule for every
category of our catalog. Our full
catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--04-02

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

1.00% | 1/each [ 1.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--04-03

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

l 1/each ‘




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--04-04

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

l 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--04-05

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

l 1/each ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Lot Total: $0.00

Item #

Line Item

Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--05-01

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--05-02

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

1.00% | 1/each 1.00%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--05-03

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

l 1/each ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--05-04

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

1/day

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

OCWUT 03-25--05-05

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Thomas Scientific
has offered a Discount Schedule for
every category of our catalog. Our
full catalog is comprehensive and
readily accessible on our website at
https://www.thomassci.com/.

Our catalog includes over 1 million
products. We continuously update
and expand our product offerings to
stay aligned with the latest research
and market demands, ensuring we
meet your evolving needs. Our
Discounts will remain firm for the
Term Length of the agreement.
Please reach out to us with any
questions regarding our response.

Lot Total: $0.00

Pacific Star Corporation

Bid Contact Angelica Delgado
customer@pfstar.com
Ph 713-527-0889

Bid Notes
no bid

Address 4350 South Wayside Drive #106
Houston, TX 77087

$0.00 (18/18items)

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes:
no bid




Item # Line Item

Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
chemical
| Alt1 | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--01-02 |Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

1000% | 1/each | 1000%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
10%
| Alt1|  10.00% | 1/each | 1000%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--01-03 |Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

n/a

OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

| 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
30 days ARO

OCWUT 03-25--01-05 |Gr0up 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

I 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
www.pfstar.com

Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--02-01 Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

no bid

Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--03-01 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS - First Offer 10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--03-02 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--04-01 Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Catalog for

Industrial

OCWUT 03-25-04-02 |

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

1000% | 1/each | 1000%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-03 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

n/a

OCWUT 03-25-04-04

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

I 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
30 days ARO

OCWUT 03-25-04-05 |

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

| 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

www.pfstar.com

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--05-01 Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

no bid

OCWUT 03-25--05-02 |

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

0.00% | 1/each | 000%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-03 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

no bid




OCWUT 03-25--05-04 Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer | 1/day ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

no bid

OCWUT 03-25--05-05 Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

VWR International, LLC

$0.00 (4/18 items)

Bid Contact  Lisa Klube Address 100 Matsonford Road, Suite 200
lisa.klube@vwr.com Radnor, PA 19087
Ph 610-386-1375
Qualifications CS ARCH ENG
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Please see
note below

Supplier Notes: Attached within
this section is Full-line General
Discount Catalog. This is to ensure
aggressive pricing is in place for all
commodities.

OCWUT 03-25--01-02 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards

| No Bids

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--01-03 |Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

| 1/each ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Please see
note below
Supplier Notes: Microscopes

OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

| 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product

Code: confidential proposal
Supplier Notes:
confidential proposal

OCWUT 03-25--01-05 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

I 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit ‘ Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--02-01 | Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/Unit‘ Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--03-01 | Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--03-02 | Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC | No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit ‘ Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--04-01 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-02 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-03 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-04 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies | No Bids




Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--04-05 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies

| No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit ‘ Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--05-01 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-02 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards l No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-03 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-04 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-05 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards l No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Hach Company $0.00 (14/18 items)

Bid Contact Staci Lamfers
bids@hach.com
Ph 800-227-4224

Bid Notes Please see price list attachment, addendum, and authorization attached and are applicable to all bidded items.

Address 5600 Lindbergh Drive
Loveland, CO 80538

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Please see price list
attachment, addendum, and
authorization attached and are
applicable to all bidded items.

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: see
Agency Notes: attached spreadsheet

Supplier Notes: 10% discount -
consumables and accessories, see
price list attachment, addendum,
and authorization attached.

OCWUT 03-25--01-02 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

10.00% | 1/each 10.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: 10% discount -
consumables and accessories, see
price list attachment, addendum,
and authorization attached.

OCWUT 03-25--01-03 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

1/each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: All pricing in
attached pricelist, no additional
discounts. see price list attachment,
addendum, and authorization
attached.




OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

I 1/day ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Standard delivery is
30 days ARO. We take exception to
the following section: Inside delivery
is required at the destination. The
contractor shall furnish and is
responsible for the cost associated
with, any items necessary (forklift,
pallets, etc.) to unload the items
from the delivery vehicle for delivery
to the final storage area. see price
list attachment, addendum, and
authorization attached.

OCWUT 03-25--01-05 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

| 1/each ‘

Supplier Product Code:

Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: www.hach.com
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--02-01 | Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit ‘ Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--03-01 | Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--03-02

Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each ‘ 10.00%

Supplier Product Code:

Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 10% discount on
consumables and accessories in
attached spreadsheet

Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--04-01 Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--04-02

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies

No Bids




Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--04-03 |

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

‘ 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-04 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer ‘ 1/day ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-05 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer l 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--05-01 Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-02 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--05-03 |

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

l 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-04 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer ‘ 1/day ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-05 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Fox Scientific Inc.

Bid Contact  Paisley Green
sales@foxscientific.com

Address 8221 E. FM 917
Alvarado, TX 76009

Ph 817-783-7500
Qualifications CS ARCH ENG MBE

$0.00 (17/18 items)

Bid Notes I have added exception to the group OCWUT 03-25--01-05

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: | have added
exception to the group OCWUT 03-
25--01-05

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Group List

Agency Notes: Pricings

Supplier Notes: Bidding Attaching
list pricing and group codes for 8
MFG

Ricca, Alpha Bioscience, Aqua
Solutions GFS Chemical, Lovibond,
Lamotte, FoxPure and
Accustandard.




Alt1

| 1/each ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: See above
Supplier Notes: See attached in
first group 1 column

OCWUT 03-25--01-02

Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - Alt 4

45.00% | 1/each | 45.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Fox Brand
Supplier Notes: Group Codes FOX3,
FOX4, FOX6

See attachment




Alt3|  40.00% | 1/each | 40.00%

roduct Code: upplier Product Code: Fox Bran:
Product Cod| Supplier Product Code: Fox Brand
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Groups Codes
FOX5 See attachment
FirstOffer|  30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Ricca
Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Codes RICT-
RIC6

See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25-01-01




Alt1

2500% | 1/each | 2500%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Aqua
Solutions

Supplier Notes: Group Codes
AQU1 and AQUD See attachment
Chemicals, Reagents & Chemicals
OCWUT 03-25--01-01

Alt 2

2500% | 1/each | 2500%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Fox Brand
Supplier Notes: Group Codes FOX1,
FOX2, FOXB See attachment
Chemicals, Reagents & Chemicals
OCWUT 03-25--01-01




Alt7

20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Alpha-
Bioscience

Supplier Notes: Group Code ALP1
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01

Alt5

15.00% | 1/each 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: GFS
Supplier Notes: Group Codes GFS1
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01




Alt 10

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Lovibond
Supplier Notes: Group Codes ORB4
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01

Alt12

1500% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Lamotte
Supplier Notes: Group Code LAM2
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25-01-01




Alt9

10.00% | 1/each ‘ 10.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Lovibond
Supplier Notes: Group Code ORB2,
ORB3

See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25-01-01




Alt 8

7.00% | 1/each | 7.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Lovibond
Supplier Notes: Group Codes ORB1
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01

Alt 11

7.00% | 1/each | 7.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Lamotte
Supplier Notes: Group Code LAM1
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01




Alt

6]  500% | 1/each |  5.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product
Code: Accustandard
Supplier Notes: Group Codes ACC1
See attachment Chemicals,
Reagents & Chemicals OCWUT 03-
25--01-01

OCWUT 03-25--01-03 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

| 1/each ‘

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: see above
Supplier Notes:
see above




1/day

OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: see above
Supplier Notes:
see above

| 1/each ‘

OCWUT 03-25--01-05 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards - First Offer

Supplier Product Code: see above
Supplier Notes: exception

Product Code:
Agency Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--02-01 Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test - First Offer 5.00% | 1/each 5.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: ECD Wipe
Agency Notes: Agilent
Supplier Notes: Item 18713-60050
is within the spreadsheet provided










Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--03-01 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS - Alt 1 30.00% | 1/each 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: |G Finneran
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: See attached

Alts| 18.00% | 1/each | 1800%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: United
Agency Notes: Scientific

Supplier Notes:
United Scientific







Alt 4]

10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Restek
Supplier Notes:
Group Code RES3







Alt3

7.00% | 1/each |

7.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Restek

Supplier Notes:
Group Code RES2







First Offer

500% | 1/each | 5.00%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Agilent
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Alt2]  500% | 1/each | 500%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Restek
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Group Code RES1







OCWUT 03-25--03-02 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC - Alt 14 40.00% | 1/each 40.00%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Dyn-A-Med
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code DYN




Alt 16

40.00% | 1/each | 40.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Fox Brand
Supplier Notes: Group Code FGO1
and FG03







Alt31

40.00% | 1/each | 40.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS7




Alt 30

35.00% | 1/each | 3500%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS6




Alt 10

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: CellTreat
Supplier Notes: Group Code CEL5




Alt12

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Control
Company
Supplier Notes: Group Code CTL







Alt13

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Cowie
Supplier Notes: Group Code COW1




Alt15

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Fox Brand
Supplier Notes: Group Codes FFO1,
FSEL, FOXG







Alt 21

30.00% | 1/each 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Globe
Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code GS5




Alt 29

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS5




Alt33

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: G Finneran
Supplier Notes: Group Code JG1




Alt46| 30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Samco
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code SAM1

Alts1|  30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Shamrock

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Code SHM1




Alt 35

2800% | 1/each | 2800%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Kimberly
Clark
Supplier Notes: Group Code KCA




Alt9

25.00% | 1/each | 25.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: CellTreat
Supplier Notes: Group Code CEL4




Alt 20

25.00% | 1/each |

25.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Globe

Scientific

Supplier Notes: Group Code GS4




Alt 28

2500% | 1/each | 2500%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS4




Alt 34/

2500% | 1/each | 2500%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Kimberly
Clark
Supplier Notes: Group Code KCW




Alts7|  2500% | 1/each | 2500%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Wheaton
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code WSP4

Altdo|  23.00% | 1/each | 2300%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Ohaus
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code OHA4

and OHAS




Alt5

20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Brandtech
Supplier Notes: Group Code BSPT







Alt 8

2000% | 1/each | 20.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: CellTreat
Supplier Notes: Group Code CEL3







Alt19

20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Globe
Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code GS3




Alt 24/

20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Hamilton
Supplier Notes: Group Code HAM3




Alt 27

2000% | 1/each | 20.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS3




Alt 39

20.00% | 1/each | 2000%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Ohaus
Supplier Notes: Group Code OHA3




Alts0|  20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Sartorious
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code SAR3

Altss| 20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Wheaton
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code WSP3

Alt38| 18.00% | 1/each | 1800%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Ohaus

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Code OHA2




Alts3|  18.00% | 1/each | 1800%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: United
Agency Notes: Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code UNI1
Alt36| 16.00% | 1/each | 1600%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Kimble

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Code KG1




Alt1

1500% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Alconox
Supplier Notes: Group Code ALC







Alt 3

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Bel-Art
Supplier Notes: Group Code BEL1







Alt4

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Brandtech
Supplier Notes: Group Codes BSLT,
BSMC




Alt7

15.00% | 1/each 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: CellTreat
Supplier Notes: Group Code CEL2







Alt18

1500% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Globe
Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code GS2




Alt 23

15.00% | 1/each |

15.00%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Hamilton
Supplier Notes: Group Code HAM2




Alt 26

1500% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS2




Alt 37

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Ohaus
Supplier Notes: Group Code OHA1




Alt42|  1500% | 1/each | 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Thermo
Agency Notes: Orion
Supplier Notes: Group Code ORI2
Alt4o| 15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Sartorious
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code SAR2

Alt 55

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%




Product Code:

Supplier Product Code: Wheaton

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code WSP2
Alt2 12.00% | 1/each 12.00%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Bel-Art

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Codes BEL2,

BEL3




Alt 6

1200% | 1/each |

12.00%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: CellTreat
Supplier Notes: Group Code CEL1




Alt 22

1200% | 1/each | 12.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Hamilton
Supplier Notes: Group Code HAM1




Alt 32

1200% | 1/each | 12.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: HF
Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code HFS1




Alt 11

1000% | 1/each | 1000%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: C&G
Conatiners
Supplier Notes: Group Code CG1







Alt 25

1000% | 1/each |  1000%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Heathrow
Supplier Notes: Group Code HRS1




Alt41

1000% | 1/each | 1000%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Thermo
Orion
Supplier Notes: Group Code ORI1




Alt4s|  10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Restek
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code RES2

Alt4s|  10.00% | 1/each [ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Sartorious

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Code SAR1




Alt 52 10.00% | 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Simport
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code SIM

Alts4|  10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Wheaton
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code WSP1

Alt44|  7.00% | 1/each | 7.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Restek
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code RES1

First Offer

500% | 1/each | 5.00%




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Advantec
MFS
Supplier Notes: GROUP Code ADV1




Alt17

500% | 1/each | 5.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: Globe
Scientific
Supplier Notes: Group Code GS1







Alt43|  5.00% | 1/each | 5.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Restek
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Group Code RES3

Al47]  5.00% | 1/each | 500%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Sartorious

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Group Code SAR




Lot Total: $0.00

Safety

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--04-01 Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: New Pig & R3







OCWUT 03-25--04-02 Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - Alt 1 20.00% | 1/each ‘ 20.00%

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
R3 Safety







First Offer

200% | 1/each |

2.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
New Pig










OCWUT 03-25-04-03 |

Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer

| 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-04 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer | 1/day ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-05 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer I 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--05-01 Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-02 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--05-03 |

Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer

I 1/each ‘

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-04 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer | 1/day ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-05 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards - First Offer | 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Metrohm USA $0.00 (2/18 items)
Bid Contact Carol Maness Address 9250 Camden Field Parkway
c¢maness@metrohmusa.com Riverview, FL 33578
Ph 813-316-4709
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--01-01 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents No Bids
and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--01-02 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents No Bids
and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--01-03 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents No Bids
and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--01-04 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents No Bids
and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--01-05 | Group 01, Bacteriological Chemicals, Media, Reagents and Standards to include Chemicals, Reagents No Bids
and Standards: Including Chemicals, Reagents and Standards
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--02-01 | Group 02, ECD Wipe Test: ECD Wipe Test No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit | Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--03-01 | Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: GCMS, MS, ICPMS No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--03-02 Group 03, General Lab Consumables not listed: IC, TOC, DOC - First Offer 15.00% | 1/each I 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: We can offer 15% discount on all consumables needed for IC.
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--04-01 |  Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-02 | Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies No Bids




Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

OCWUT 03-25--04-03 l Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-04 ‘ Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--04-05 l Group 04, Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies: Industrial Hygiene and Safety Supplies No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
OCWUT 03-25--05-01 | Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-02 ‘ Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-03 l Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-04 ‘ Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
OCWUT 03-25--05-05 ‘ Group 05, Proficiency Testing Standards: Proficiency Testing Standards No Bids

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Tresha Williams

Close

Chad Harrison

City Clerk

Purchasing Agent

Tim Alvarez

THE BID COMMITTEE DOES NOT REJECT OR ACCEPT BIDS. The noting or failing to note on the bid
tabulation any defect by the Bid Committee is not conclusive of the validity, regularity, completeness or

legality of any bid. Questions regarding bid defects or irregularities should be directed to the Municipal
Counselor’s Office at (405) 297-2451.
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