
  

 
  

 
  

 
  

 
  

 

City Clerk

Bid OCWUT WC-1046 Ended At Oct 11, 2023 10:00:00 AM CDT
CONSTRUCTION/OCWUT - 16-inch Waterline Extension

Company: 4M Trenching, LLC Matthews Trenching Co., Inc. Cimarron Construction Company,
LLC

BASE BID $1,998,418.00 $2,041,400.00 $2,441,441.00

TOTAL BID: $1,998,418.00 $2,041,400.00 $2,441,441.00

Company: Krapff Reynolds Construction
Company

United Trenching, Inc. Southwest Water Works L.L.C.

BASE BID $2,863,545.00 $2,966,530.00 $6,235,525.00

TOTAL BID: $2,863,545.00 $2,966,530.00 $6,235,525.00

________________________
City Clerk

            ________________________
            Auditor
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Bid #OCWUT WC-1046 - 16-inch Waterline Extension

 

Creation Date   Aug 25, 2023 End Date Oct 11, 2023 10:00:00 AM CDT

Start Date Sep 13, 2023 7:50:59 AM CDT Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-01   BASE BID: 16-IN FUSIBLE BUTE PRESSURE PIPE (PR235)(C905)(DR-18)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $400.00     2894 / linear foot $1,157,600.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $425.00     2894 / linear foot $1,229,950.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $472.00     2894 / linear foot $1,365,968.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

Bid Bond Attached 

 

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $600.00     2894 / linear foot $1,736,400.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: Bid bond attached to this bid item. 

 

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $735.00     2894 / linear foot $2,127,090.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $1,350.00     2894 / linear foot $3,906,900.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-02   BASE BID: 16-IN C-905 PVC (DR-18)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $140.00     372 / linear foot $52,080.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $200.00     372 / linear foot $74,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $290.00     372 / linear foot $107,880.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $435.00     372 / linear foot $161,820.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $540.00     372 / linear foot $200,880.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $950.00     372 / linear foot $353,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  
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 OCWUT WC-1046--01-03   BASE BID: 12-IN C-900 PVC (DR-14)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $105.00     88 / linear foot $9,240.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $130.00     88 / linear foot $11,440.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $200.00     88 / linear foot $17,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $275.00     88 / linear foot $24,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $530.00     88 / linear foot $46,640.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $800.00     88 / linear foot $70,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-04   BASE BID: 6-IN C-900 PVC (DR-14)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $100.00     30 / linear foot $3,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $100.00     30 / linear foot $3,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $195.00     30 / linear foot $5,850.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $200.00     30 / linear foot $6,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $450.00     30 / linear foot $13,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $480.00     30 / linear foot $14,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-05   BASE BID: 16X16 TAPPING SLEEVE (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $7,000.00     1 / each $7,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $10,000.00     1 / each $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $11,600.00     1 / each $11,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $12,000.00     1 / each $12,000.00     Y
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Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $13,775.00     1 / each $13,775.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $15,000.00     1 / each $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-06   BASE BID: 12X12 TAPPING SLEEVE (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $6,000.00     3 / each $18,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     3 / each $22,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $7,500.00     3 / each $22,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $9,000.00     3 / each $27,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $10,000.00     3 / each $30,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $12,525.00     3 / each $37,575.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-07   BASE BID: 16-IN TAPPING VALVE AND BOX (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $8,000.00     1 / each $8,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $14,500.00     1 / each $14,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $17,100.00     1 / each $17,100.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $17,500.00     1 / each $17,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $17,500.00     1 / each $17,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $18,000.00     1 / each $18,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-08   BASE BID: 12-IN TAPPING VALVE AND BOX (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $4,500.00     3 / each $13,500.00     Y

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $6,200.00     3 / each $18,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $6,300.00     3 / each $18,900.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $6,800.00     3 / each $20,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $7,000.00     3 / each $21,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $15,000.00     3 / each $45,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-09   BASE BID: 16-IN BUTTERFLY VALVE (MJ) AND BOX

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $5,800.00     4 / each $23,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $7,640.00     4 / each $30,560.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $8,000.00     4 / each $32,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $11,000.00     4 / each $44,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $14,000.00     4 / each $56,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $20,000.00     4 / each $80,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-10   BASE BID: 6-IN GATE VALVE (MJ) AND BOX

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $1,620.00     4 / each $6,480.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $1,700.00     4 / each $6,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $2,500.00     4 / each $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $2,500.00     4 / each $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $3,000.00     4 / each $12,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  
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Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     4 / each $30,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-11   BASE BID: 16-IN SOLID SLEEVE (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $1,625.00     16 / each $26,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $1,800.00     16 / each $28,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $2,200.00     16 / each $35,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $2,200.00     16 / each $35,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $2,800.00     16 / each $44,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $3,500.00     16 / each $56,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-12   BASE BID: 16X12 REDUCUER (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $1,100.00     1 / each $1,100.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $1,350.00     1 / each $1,350.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $1,600.00     1 / each $1,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $2,000.00     1 / each $2,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $2,100.00     1 / each $2,100.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $4,000.00     1 / each $4,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-13   BASE BID: 16X12 TEE (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $2,460.00     2 / each $4,920.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $2,500.00     2 / each $5,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $3,100.00     2 / each $6,200.00     Y
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Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $3,500.00     2 / each $7,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $4,000.00     2 / each $8,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     2 / each $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-14   BASE BID: 16X6 TEE (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $2,085.00     4 / each $8,340.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $2,300.00     4 / each $9,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $2,600.00     4 / each $10,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $3,200.00     4 / each $12,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $3,500.00     4 / each $14,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     4 / each $30,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-15   BASE BID: 16X45 DEG BEND (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $2,200.00     2 / each $4,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $2,300.00     2 / each $4,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $2,320.00     2 / each $4,640.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $2,500.00     2 / each $5,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $2,950.00     2 / each $5,900.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     2 / each $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-16   BASE BID: 16X90 DEG BEND (MJ)
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 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $2,135.00     1 / each $2,135.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $2,700.00     1 / each $2,700.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $2,800.00     1 / each $2,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $3,400.00     1 / each $3,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $4,100.00     1 / each $4,100.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     1 / each $7,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-17   BASE BID: 10X90 DEG BEND (MJ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $810.00     1 / each $810.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $1,000.00     1 / each $1,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $1,200.00     1 / each $1,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $1,500.00     1 / each $1,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $1,600.00     1 / each $1,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $4,500.00     1 / each $4,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-18   BASE BID: FIRE HYDRANT ASSY

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $4,000.00     4 / each $16,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $4,650.00     4 / each $18,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $6,000.00     4 / each $24,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $7,500.00     4 / each $30,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  
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Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $8,500.00     4 / each $34,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $12,500.00     4 / each $50,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-19   BASE BID: 12-IN RISER (IF REQ)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $425.00     4 / each $1,700.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $500.00     4 / each $2,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $850.00     4 / each $3,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $900.00     4 / each $3,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $975.00     4 / each $3,900.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $1,000.00     4 / each $4,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-20   BASE BID: CUT AND REMOVE EX 20-IN STEEL ENCASEMENT

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $100.00     10 / linear foot $1,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $161.00     10 / linear foot $1,610.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $400.00     10 / linear foot $4,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $750.00     10 / linear foot $7,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $1,000.00     10 / linear foot $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $3,000.00     10 / linear foot $30,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-21   BASE BID: STEEL ENCASEMENT FOR 16-IN WATERLINE

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $250.00     16 / linear foot $4,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $400.00     16 / linear foot $6,400.00     Y
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Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $450.00     16 / linear foot $7,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $500.00     16 / linear foot $8,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $500.00     16 / linear foot $8,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $1,000.00     16 / linear foot $16,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-22   BASE BID: BORE AND STEEL ENCASEMENT FOR 16-IN WATERLINE

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $575.00     230 / linear foot $132,250.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $850.00     230 / linear foot $195,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $967.00     230 / linear foot $222,410.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $1,250.00     230 / linear foot $287,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $2,000.00     230 / linear foot $460,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $2,450.00     230 / linear foot $563,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-23   BASE BID: BORE AND STEEL ENCASEMENT FOR 12-IN WATERLINE

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $450.00     57 / linear foot $25,650.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $488.00     57 / linear foot $27,816.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $650.00     57 / linear foot $37,050.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $700.00     57 / linear foot $39,900.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $1,000.00     57 / linear foot $57,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $1,500.00     57 / linear foot $85,500.00     Y

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-24   BASE BID: REMOVE AND REPLACE CONC CURB AND GUTTER (2 FT-0IN)(8-IN BARRIER)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $30.00     280 / linear foot $8,400.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $35.00     280 / linear foot $9,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $65.00     280 / linear foot $18,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $75.00     280 / linear foot $21,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $90.00     280 / linear foot $25,200.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $125.00     280 / linear foot $35,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-25   BASE BID: PAVING CUT AND PERM PAVING REPAIR (PC CON)(10-IN)(DOWEL JOINTED)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $109.00     541 / square yard $58,969.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $220.00     541 / square yard $119,020.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $275.00     541 / square yard $148,775.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $310.00     541 / square yard $167,710.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $310.00     541 / square yard $167,710.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $325.00     541 / square yard $175,825.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-26   BASE BID: CONSTRUCTION STAKING (CONSTRUCTION SURVEY)

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $12,700.00     1 / lump sum $12,700.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $13,000.00     1 / lump sum $13,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $15,000.00     1 / lump sum $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  
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Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $17,500.00     1 / lump sum $17,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $18,000.00     1 / lump sum $18,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $150,000.00     1 / lump sum $150,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-27   BASE BID: CONSTRUCTION SIGNING AND TRAFFIC CONTROL

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $27,000.00     1 / lump sum $27,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $33,000.00     1 / lump sum $33,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $40,000.00     1 / lump sum $40,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $40,000.00     1 / lump sum $40,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $90,000.00     1 / lump sum $90,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $150,000.00     1 / lump sum $150,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-28   BASE BID: SEDIMENT AND EROSION CONTROL

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $7,500.00     1 / lump sum $7,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $10,000.00     1 / lump sum $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $12,500.00     1 / lump sum $12,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $15,000.00     1 / lump sum $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $17,000.00     1 / lump sum $17,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $150,000.00     1 / lump sum $150,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-29   BASE BID: HYDROSTATIC PRESSURE TESTING AND DISINFECTION

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $4,500.00     1 / lump sum $4,500.00     Y
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Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $5,000.00     1 / lump sum $5,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $10,000.00     1 / lump sum $10,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $15,000.00     1 / lump sum $15,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $35,000.00     1 / lump sum $35,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $150,000.00     1 / lump sum $150,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

 OCWUT WC-1046--01-30   BASE BID: COLOR AUDIO VIDEO RECORDING PRE/POST

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

4M Trenching, LLC   First Offer -  $1,000.00     1 / lump sum $1,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Krapff Reynolds Construction Company   First Offer -  $2,500.00     1 / lump sum $2,500.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.   First Offer -  $5,000.00     1 / lump sum $5,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Cimarron Construction Company, LLC   First Offer -  $9,641.00     1 / lump sum $9,641.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

United Trenching, Inc.   First Offer -  $17,000.00     1 / lump sum $17,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Southwest Water Works L.L.C.   First Offer -  $150,000.00     1 / lump sum $150,000.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

Supplier Totals

f   4M Trenching, LLC $1,998,418.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Mitchell Manning 

adam@4mtrenching.com 

Ph 405-942-4175  

 Address  4912 Bishop Dr

Oklahoma City, OK 73128

 Qualifications   CS ARCH ENGS   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

f   Matthews Trenching Co., Inc. $2,041,400.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Gary Matthews 

pferguson@mtciokc.com 

Ph 405-677-4525   

Fax 405-677-4835

 Address  919 S Fairmont Ave

Oklahoma City, OK 73129
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 Qualifications   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

f   Cimarron Construction Company, LLC $2,441,441.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Don E Noble 

CM@cimarronconstructionco.com 

Ph 405-728-1555   

Fax 405-728-5026

 Address  3501 NE. 63rd Street

Oklahoma City, OK 73121

 Qualifications   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

 Bid Bond     (Status: This bid bond could not be verified)

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

f   Krapff Reynolds Construction Company $2,863,545.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Jim King 

fred@krapff-reynolds.com 

Ph 405-733-9682   

Fax 405-516-0081

 Address  2400 N.E. 4th st

Oklahoma City, OK 73117

 Qualifications   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

 Bid Notes   Bid bond attached to item 1

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Bid bond attached to item 1 

Head Attch:

 

f   United Trenching, Inc. $2,966,530.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Tony Ellison 

unitedtrenching@aol.com 

Ph 405-376-1122  

 Address  5506 Stewart Drive

Mustang, OK 73064

 Qualifications   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

f   Southwest Water Works L.L.C. $6,235,525.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Paul Matthews 

paul@swwaterworks.com 

Ph 405990   

Fax 405-463-5665

 Address  201 NW 132nd St

Oklahoma City, OK 73114

 Qualifications   OKC PRE-QUALIFIED CONTRACTORS  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet. However, the listing of the bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet

shall not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being

responsive. The agency will make a determination as to the responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws,

purchasing guidelines and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The agency will notify the successful

vendor upon award of the contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received may be available for inspection at that time.

bid #OCWUT WC-1046 -
16-inch Waterline Extension

City of Oklahoma City and
its Trusts

10/11/2023 p. 13



Bid #24709 - SECURITY SERVICES FOR MUNICIPAL COURT 

 

Creation Date   Sep 12, 2023 End Date Oct 11, 2023 10:00:00 AM CDT

Start Date Sep 20, 2023 7:54:44 AM CDT Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

Stonewall Security $792.00    (14/14 items)

 Bid Contact Richard Sturt 

stonewallsecserv@gmail.com 

Ph 405-250-7793  

 Address 1712 Fremont Dr

Oklahoma City , OK 73120

 Bid Notes  

2 guards @ $36/hr

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-01-01 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 1 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr 

 24709-

-01-02 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 2 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr 

 24709-

-01-03 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 3 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr 

  Lot Total: $216.00  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-02-01 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-02 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 
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2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-03 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-04 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-05 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-06 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-07 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

 24709-

-02-08 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$72.00      1 / each $72.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

2 guards @ $36/hr

  Lot Total: $576.00  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-03-01 

Qualifications: Company Qualifications - Do Not ZIP Files. -

First Offer

     1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-03-02 

Qualifications: Uniform - Do Not ZIP Files. - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

 Item  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 
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#

 24709-

-04-01 

Attachments: Internal Revenue Service W-9 Form - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

Goodwill Industries of Central Oklahoma $19,024.47    (14/14 items)

 Bid Contact Joe Muller 

jmuller@okgoodwill.org 

Ph 405-278-7145  

 Address 316 S. Blackwelder Avenue

Oklahoma City, OK 73108

Oklahoma City, OK 73108

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-01-01 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 1 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$18,807.47      1 / each $18,807.47  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-01-02 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 2 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

 24709-

-01-03 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 3 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

  Lot Total: $18,807.47  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-02-01 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$86.80      1 / each $86.80  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: Price is for 2 unarmed security officers/hour (each officer

is $43.40/hour). 

 24709-

-02-02 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

 24709-

-02-03 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

 24709-

-02-04 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$86.80      1 / each $86.80  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: Price is for 2 officers/hour (i.e., each officer is $43.40 per

hour). 
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 24709-

-02-05 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

 24709-

-02-06 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

 24709-

-02-07 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$43.40      1 / each $43.40  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: Price is for 1 unarmed officer per hour. 

 24709-

-02-08 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$0.00      1 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: No bid. 

  Lot Total: $217.00  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-03-01 

Qualifications: Company Qualifications - Do Not ZIP Files. -

First Offer

     1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-03-02 

Qualifications: Uniform - Do Not ZIP Files. - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-04-01 

Attachments: Internal Revenue Service W-9 Form - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

Direct Protective Services, LLC $59,082.32    (14/14 items)

 Bid Contact Justin Roberson 

admin@directprotective.com 

Ph 405-249-4181  

 Address 2700 Coltrane Place Suite 1

Edmond, OK 73034

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-01-01 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 1 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$10,009.80      1 / each $10,009.80  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-01-02 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 2 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$25,730.00      1 / each $25,730.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-01-03 

Security Monitoring: Option No. 3 including staffing and

equipment. - First Offer

$22,874.00      1 / each $22,874.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $58,613.80  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-02-01 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$48.24      1 / each $48.24  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-02 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$62.00      1 / each $62.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-03 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$55.12      1 / each $55.12  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-04 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$72.36      1 / each $72.36  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-05 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$93.00      1 / each $93.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-06 

Additional Service: Option No. 3 for unanticpated hours

extending beyond normal service hours. - First Offer

$82.68      1 / each $82.68  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-07 

Additional Service: Option No. 1 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$24.12      1 / each $24.12  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-02-08 

Additional Service: Option No. 2 for requested additional

service. - First Offer

$31.00      1 / each $31.00  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $468.52  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 24709-

-03-01 

Qualifications: Company Qualifications - Do Not ZIP Files. -

First Offer

     1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

 24709-

-03-02 

Qualifications: Uniform - Do Not ZIP Files. - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

 Item

#
 Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 
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 24709-

-04-01 

Attachments: Internal Revenue Service W-9 Form - First Offer      1 / each  

Product Code:  

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  
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