THE BID COMMITTEE WILL MEET
IN THE CITY CLERK’S CONFERENCE

Bid #24104 - Closed Circuit Television and Genetec Access Control

Creation Date Jul 21, 2023

: . . ROOM, 200 N. WALKER 2ND FLOOR,
Bid Committee Bid Tab MUNICIPAL BUILDING, AT 10:00 A.M.
OR LATER.
End Date Aug 16, 2023 10:00:00 AM CDT

Start Date Jul 26, 2023 7:54:15 AM CDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded
tkm20042 $0.00 (49/49 items)
Bid Contact Norman Ruud Address 4510 Country Club Drive
norman@turnkeymobile.com Jefferson City, MO 65109
Ph 573-893-9888
Qualifications CS ARCH ENGS
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-01-01 CCTV Installation and Services: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-01-02 CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-01-03 CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
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24104-01-04 CCTV Installation and Services: Installation - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-01-05 CCTV Installation and Services: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-02-01 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-02-02 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid




24104-02-03 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-02-04 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-02-05 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer I 1/each I
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price

24104-03-01

Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer

0.00% | 1/each 0.00%




Supplier Product Code:

Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-03-02 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-04-01 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid
24104-04-02 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid




Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-05-01 Genetec Software Licensing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders. Requires customers
GSC number
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

24104-06-01 | Genetec Software Licensing-Federal Pricing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer

15.00% | 1/each 15.00%

Supplier Product Code: 680-02

Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer will need
to call for pricing with their GSC
number.

Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-07-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 630-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may

receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.




24104-07-02

CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-02
Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.

24104-07-03

CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer

15.00% | 1/each 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.

24104-07-04

CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes: No Bid




CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘

24104-07-05
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-08-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-08-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-08-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-08-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid




24104-08-05 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer | 1/each |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: N/A

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-09-01 Genetec Access Control: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-02 Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/ hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-03 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-04 Genetec Access Control: Installation - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-05 Genetec Access Control: Minimum Charge - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-06 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may

receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.




24104-09-07 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-09-08 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-09-09 Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-09-10 Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-10-01 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-10-02 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-10-03 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: No Bid




24104-10-04

Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer

$0.00 | 1/hour | $0.00

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes: No Bid

24104-10-05

Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer

‘ 1/each |

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes: No Bid

24104-10-06

Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer

15.00% | 1/each | 15.00%

Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.

24104-10-07

Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer

15.00% | 1/each 15.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.




24104-10-08 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 680-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Customer may
receive deeper discount for larger
volume orders.
24104-10-09 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
24104-10-10 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-11-01 Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Letter of

Authorization;

Turn-Key Security Solutions Genetec
Certification;

Missouri WBE Certification




24104-11-02 Attachments: W-9 - First Offer | 1/each |

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-12-01 Federal FTA Contract Clauses / Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00
Techsico $1,105.00 (49/49 items)
Bid Contact  Arianna Phillips Address 910 South Hudson
arianna.phillips@techsico.com Tulsa, OK 74112
Ph 918-288-3764

Qualifications CS ARCH ENGS

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-01-01 CCTV Installation and Services: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $150.00 | 1/hour $150.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME

FOR PROGRAMMING

24104-01-02 CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $115.00 | 1/hour $115.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME

FOR TECHNICIAN.




24104-01-03

CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer| $172.50 ‘ 1/hour ‘ $172.50

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PREMIUM TIME
FOR TECHNICIAN M-F AFTER
HOURS.
WEEKEND/HOLIDAYS/EMERGENCY
RATES ARE 230.00
24104-01-04 CCTV Installation and Services: Installation - First Offer|  $115.00 | 1/hour $115.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME
FOR TECHNICIAN
24104-01-05 CCTV Installation and Services: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: TWO HOUR

MINIMUM CHARGE FOR ANY WORK.




Lot Total: $552.50

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-02-01 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $150.00 | 1/hour $150.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME
FOR PROGRAMMING.
24104-02-02 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $115.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $115.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME
FOR TECHNICIAN.
24104-02-03 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $172.50 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $172.50
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PREMIUM TIME

FORTECHNICIAN M-F AFTER
HOURS.
WEEKEND/HOLIDAYS/EMERGENCY
RATES ARE 230.00




CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer

$11500 | 1/hour | $115.00

24104-02-04
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: STRAIGHT TIME
FOR TECHNICIAN.
24104-02-05 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer I 1/each I
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: TWO HOUR
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR ANY JOB.
Lot Total: $552.50
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-03-01 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  30.00% | 1/each 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PERCENTAGE OF

MARKUP




Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer

30.00% | 1/each | 30.00%

24104-03-02
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PERCENTAGE OF
MARKUP
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-04-01 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  30.00% | 1/each 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PERCETNAGE OF
MARKUP
24104-04-02 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  30.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 30.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: PERCETNAGE OF

MARKUP




Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
Genetec Software Licensing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%

24104-05-01
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. THIS
BID IS FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-06-01 | Genetec Software Licensing-Federal Pricing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC ITEMS. BID IS FOR CCTV

PORTION ONLY.

Lot Total: $0.00
Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price

Item # Line Item




24104-07-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 15.00% ‘ 1/each | 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: AXIS DISCOUNT
24104-07-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 20.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: HANWHA

DISCOUNT




24104-07-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: BOSCH DISCOUNT
24104-07-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: N/A




‘ 1/each |

24104-07-05 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: N/A

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-08-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: AXIS DISCOUNT
24104-08-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 20.00% | 1/each | 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: HANWHA
DISCOUNT

Agency Notes:




24104-08-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: BOSCH DISCOUNT
24104-08-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: N/A




24104-08-05 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: N/A
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-09-01 Genetec Access Control: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-02 Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-03 Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-04 Genetec Access Control: Installation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-05 Genetec Access Control: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY

GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.




24104-09-06 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-07 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-08 Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-09 Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-09-10 Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-10-01 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-02 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00




Product Code:

Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-03 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-04 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-05 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-06 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-07 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% I 1/each I 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-08 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% I 1/each I 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY




GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.

24104-10-09 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: CANNOT SUPPLY
GENETEC. BID IS FOR CCTV
PORTION ONLY.
24104-10-10 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
CANNOT SUPPLY GENETEC. BID IS
FOR CCTV PORTION ONLY.
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-11-01 Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-11-02 Attachments: W-9 - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-12-01 Federal FTA Contract Clauses / Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Entech $1,520.00 (49/49 items)

Bid Contact Ronnie Robison

ronnie.robison@entechsales.com

Ph 405-443-0379
Qualifications CS ARCH ENGS

Address 3808 E. I-240 Service RD
Oklahoma City, OK 73135

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-01-01 CCTV Installation and Services: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/hour $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

24104-01-02 | CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

24104-01-03 |

CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer

$95.00 | 1/hour |  $95.00




Product Code:

Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-01-04 | CCTV Installation and Services: Installation - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-01-05 | CCTV Installation and Services: Minimum Charge - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $380.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-02-01 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/hour $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-02-02 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-02-03 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-02-04 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/ hour | $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-02-05 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $380.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-03-01 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-03-02 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-04-01 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-04-02 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-05-01 Genetec Software Licensing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-06-01 | Genetec Software Licensing-Federal Pricing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price ‘ Qty/Unit‘TotaI Price




24104-07-01 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-07-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
quip g
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-07-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
quip g
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-07-04 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-07-05 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-08-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-08-02 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-08-03 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-08-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
quip g
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-08-05 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-09-01 Genetec Access Control: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/hour $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-02 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-03 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-04 | Genetec Access Control: Installation - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-05 | Genetec Access Control: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-06 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-07 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% | 1/each | 10.00%




Product Code:

Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-08 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-09 | Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer|  10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-09-10 | Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $380.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-10-01 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/hour $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-02 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-03 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $95.00 | 1/ hour | $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-04 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $95.00 | 1/hour | $95.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-05 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-06 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-07 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-08 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-09 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer| ~ 10.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-10 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $380.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-11-01 Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-11-02 Attachments: W-9 - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

24104-12-01

Federal FTA Contract Clauses / Attachments: Attachments - First Offer

1/each




Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Tricorps Surveillance

Bid Contact Houston Tracy
chadbradley@tricorps.com

Ph 405-431-8845
Fax 405-621-9033

$906.00 (48/49 items)

Address 12312 Hidden Forest bivd
oklahoma city , OK 73142

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-01-01 CCTV Installation and Services: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $115.00 | 1/hour $115.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Normal business hours,
programming
24104-01-02 CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $105.00 | 1/ hour | $105.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
2 hour response time, M-F, 8-5
24104-01-03 CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $135.00 | 1/ hour | $135.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
4 hour response time, after normal
business hours
24104-01-04 CCTV Installation and Services: Installation - First Offer $98.00 ‘ 1/hour ‘ $98.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Installation, Normal Business Hours,
Scheduled projects.
24104-01-05 CCTV Installation and Services: Minimum Charge - First Offer I 1/each I
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
$98/hour
Lot Total: $453.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-02-01 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $115.00 | 1/hour $115.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:




Normal business hours,
programming

24104-02-02 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $105.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $105.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
2 hour response time, M-F, 8-5
24104-02-03 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $135.00 | 1/hour | $135.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
4 hour response time, after normal
business hours
24104-02-04 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $98.00 | 1/hour $98.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Installation, Normal Business Hours.
Scheduled projects.
24104-02-05 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $453.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-03-01 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer| ~ 15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
15% off MSRP for misc. parts,
hardware, cabling and connectors.
24104-03-02 | Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-04-01 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 15% off misc parts,
cabling, connectors
24104-04-02 Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-05-01 Genetec Software Licensing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

No Bid.




Lot Total: $0.00
Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
0.00% | 1/each 0.00%

Item # Line ltem
24104-06-01 | Genetec Software Licensing-Federal Pricing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.

Lot Total: $0.00
Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price

Item # Line Item
24104-07-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  12.00% | 1/each 12.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 12% discount off
MSRP Axis Communication Products
24104-07-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 7.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 7.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
7% discount off MSRP for Bosch
Products
24104-07-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 25.00% | 1/each | 25.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
25% discount off MSRP for Hanwha

Vision Products

CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%

24104-07-04
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

Agency Notes:
No bid.




‘ 1/each ‘

24104-07-05 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-08-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  12.00% | 1/each 12.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
12% discount off MSRP Axis
Communication Products
24104-08-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 7.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 7.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
7% discount off MSRP for Bosch
Products
24104-08-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer| ~ 25.00% | 1/each | 25.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
25% discount off MSRP for Hanwha
Vision Products.
24104-08-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid.
24104-08-05 CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-09-01 Genetec Access Control: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-09-02 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 | 1/ hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-09-03 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00




Product Code:

Supplier Product Code:

en otes: upplier Notes:
cy N Supplier N

No Bid.
24104-09-04 | Genetec Access Control: Installation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/ hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

en otes: upplier Notes:

Agency N Supplier N

No Bid.
24104-09-05 | Genetec Access Control: Minimum Charge - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

- enetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer .00% ead .00%
24104-09-06 G A C |: Catalog or Price List - First Off 0.00% | 1/each 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

en otes: upplier Notes:
Agency N Supplier N
No Bid.
24104-09-07 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
en otes: upplier Notes:
cy N Supplier N
No Bid.
24104-09-08 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
en otes: upplier Notes:
Agency N Supplier N
No Bid.
24104-09-09 | Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-09-10 | Genetec Access Control: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-10-01 Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/hour $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-10-02 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-10-03 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer $0.00 ‘ 1/hour ‘ $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-10-04 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $0.00 | 1/ hour | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid.
24104-10-05 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-10-06 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
en otes: upplier Notes:
cy N Supplier N
No Bid.
24104-10-07 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes:




No Bid.

24104-10-08 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List - First Offer 0.00% | 1/each | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-10-09 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer 0.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
No Bid.
24104-10-10 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-11-01 Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Letter of Authorization
24104-11-02 Attachments: W-9 - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-12-01 Federal FTA Contract Clauses / Attachments: Attachments - First Offer 1/each
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Trans-Tel, LLC

Bid Contact Aaron Hallmark
aaron.hallmark@trans-tel.com
Ph 405-513-4980

Bid Notes None

$890.00 (16/49 items)

Address 2851 N. Flood Ave

Norman, OK 73069

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: None
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-01-01 CCTV Installation and Services: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $120.00 | 1/hour $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Programming
Supplier Notes:
24104-01-02 | CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $120.00 | 1/ hour | $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /Service
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
24104-01-03 | CCTV Installation and Services: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $120.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Maintenance
Supplier Notes:
24104-01-04 | CCTV Installation and Services: Installation - First Offer $85.00 | 1/ hour | $85.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Installation
Supplier Notes:
24104-01-05 | CCTV Installation and Services: Minimum Charge - First Offer ‘ 1/each ‘
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

None




Lot Total: $445.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit|Total Price
24104-02-01 CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation - First Offer|  $120.00 | 1/hour $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Programming
Supplier Notes:
24104-02-02 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $120.00 | 1/hour | $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Maintenance
Supplier Notes:
24104-02-03 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service - First Offer|  $120.00 ‘ 1/ hour ‘ $120.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Maintenance
Supplier Notes:
24104-02-04 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Installation - First Offer $85.00 ‘ 1/hour ‘ $85.00
Product Code: Supplier Product
Agency Notes: Code: /Installation
Supplier Notes:
24104-02-05 | CCTV Installation and Services-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge - First Offer | 1/each |
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
none
Lot Total: $445.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-03-01 Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories - First Offer|  20.00% | 1/each 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /MISC
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Cost plus 25%
24104-03-02 | Additional Parts and Pieces: Additional Parts and Accessories ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price QtlenitITotaI Price
24104-04-01 | Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-04-02 | Additional Parts and Pieces-Federal Pricing: Additional Parts and Accessories ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/UnitITotaI Price
24104-05-01 | Genetec Software Licensing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
24104-06-01 | Genetec Software Licensing-Federal Pricing: Genetec Security Center Yearly Software Licenses - First Offer|  15.00% | 1/each 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /Genetec
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 15% off MSRP
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price ‘ Qty/Unit‘TotaI Price




24104-07-01 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  15.00% ‘ 1/each ‘ 15.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /AXIS
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 15% off MSRP
24104-07-02 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  20.00% | 1/each 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /Bosch
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 20% off MSRP
24104-07-03 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Catalog or Price List - First Offer|  20.00% | 1/each 20.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /HANWHA
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 20% off MSRP
24104-07-04 CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website - First Offer|  10.00% | 1/each 10.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: /Graybar
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Graybar Omnia
contract pricing for cable,
connectors, conduit and fittings,
mounting hardware.
24104-07-05 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras: Website | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/Unit‘TotaI Price
24104-08-01 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-08-02 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-08-03 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-08-04 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-08-05 | CCTV Equipment and Cameras-Federal Pricing: Website ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/UnitITotaI Price
24104-09-01 | Genetec Access Control: Programming and or Assimilation No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-09-02 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-09-03 | Genetec Access Control: Maintenance and or Service ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-09-04 | Genetec Access Control: Installation ‘ No Bids




Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-05 | Genetec Access Control: Minimum Charge ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-06 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-07 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-08 | Genetec Access Control: Catalog or Price List | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-09 | Genetec Access Control: Website | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-09-10 | Genetec Access Control: Website ‘ No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/Unit‘TotaI Price
24104-10-01 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Programming and or Assimilation No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-02 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-03 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Maintenance and or Service ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-04 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Installation ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-05 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Minimum Charge ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-06 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-07 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-08 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Catalog or Price List | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-09 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website | No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:
24104-10-10 | Genetec Access Control-Federal Pricing: Website | No Bids

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # | Line Item Unit Price ‘ Qty/Unit‘TotaI Price




24104-11-01 | Attachments: Attachments ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
24104-11-02 | Attachments: W-9 ‘ No Bids
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:
Lot Total: $0.00
Item # Line Item Unit Price Qty/UnitITotaI Price
24104-12-01 | Federal FTA Contract Clauses / Attachments: Attachments No Bids

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $0.00

Tresha Williams Angee Wagner

Tim Alvarez

City Clerk Purchasing Agent

Auditor

THE BID COMMITTEE DOES NOT REJECT OR ACCEPT BIDS. The noting or failing to note on the bid
tabulation any defect by the Bid Committee is not conclusive of the validity, regularity, completeness or

legality of any bid. Questions regarding bid defects or irregularities should be directed to the Municipal

Counselor’s Office at (405) 297-2451.
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